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Harry Potter and the Chamber of Secrets

'There is a plot, Harry Potter. A plot to make most terrible things happen at Hogwarts School of Witchcraft
and Wizardry this year.' Harry Potter's summer has included the worst birthday ever, doomy warnings from a
house-elf called Dobby, and rescue from the Dursleys by his friend Ron Weasley in a magical flying car!
Back at Hogwarts School of Witchcraft and Wizardry for his second year, Harry hears strange whispers echo
through empty corridors - and then the attacks start. Students are found as though turned to stone... Dobby's
sinister predictions seem to be coming true. Having become classics of our time, the Harry Potter eBooks
never fail to bring comfort and escapism. With their message of hope, belonging and the enduring power of
truth and love, the story of the Boy Who Lived continues to delight generations of new readers.

The Advocate

The Advocate is a lesbian, gay, bisexual, transgender (LGBT) monthly newsmagazine. Established in 1967,
it is the oldest continuing LGBT publication in the United States.

The Sociology of Science Fiction

Well-known critic Brian Stableford, a former professor at the University of Reading, contributes \"a
fascinating and valuable attempt to grapple with the questions of why SF authors write what they write, and
why SF readers like what they like\"-Interzone. Contents: Introduction; Approaches to the Sociology of
Literature; The Analysis of Communicative Functions; The Evolution of Science Fiction as a Publishing
Category; The Expectations of the Science Fiction Reader; Themes and Trends in Science Fiction; and
Conclusion: The Communicative Functions of Science Fiction. Complete with Notes and References,
Bibliography, and Index.

Understanding Media

When first published, Marshall McLuhan's Understanding Media made history with its radical view of the
effects of electronic communications upon man and life in the twentieth century.

Become a Problem-Solving Crime Analyst

Crime analysis has become an increasingly important part of policing and crime prevention, and thousands of
specialist crime analysts are now employed by police forces worldwide. This is the first book to set out the
principles and practice of crime analysis, and is designed to be used both by crime analysts themselves, by
those responsible for the training of crime analysts and teaching its principles, and those teaching this subject
as part of broader policing and criminal justice courses. The particular focus of this book is on the adoption
of a problem solving approach, showing how crime analysis can be used and developed to support a problem



oriented policing approach – based on the idea that the police should concentrate on identifying patterns of
crime and anticipating crimes rather than just reacting to crimes once they have been committed. In his
foreword to this book, Nick Ross, presenter of BBC Crime Watch, argues passionately that crime analysts are
'the new face of policing', and have a crucial part to play in the increasingly sophisticated police response to
crime and its approach to crime prevention – 'You are the brains, the expert, the specialist, the boffin.'

The Signal and the Noise

\"One of the more momentous books of the decade.\" —The New York Times Book Review Nate Silver built
an innovative system for predicting baseball performance, predicted the 2008 election within a hair’s breadth,
and became a national sensation as a blogger—all by the time he was thirty. He solidified his standing as the
nation's foremost political forecaster with his near perfect prediction of the 2012 election. Silver is the
founder and editor in chief of the website FiveThirtyEight. Drawing on his own groundbreaking work, Silver
examines the world of prediction, investigating how we can distinguish a true signal from a universe of noisy
data. Most predictions fail, often at great cost to society, because most of us have a poor understanding of
probability and uncertainty. Both experts and laypeople mistake more confident predictions for more accurate
ones. But overconfidence is often the reason for failure. If our appreciation of uncertainty improves, our
predictions can get better too. This is the “prediction paradox”: The more humility we have about our ability
to make predictions, the more successful we can be in planning for the future. In keeping with his own aim to
seek truth from data, Silver visits the most successful forecasters in a range of areas, from hurricanes to
baseball to global pandemics, from the poker table to the stock market, from Capitol Hill to the NBA. He
explains and evaluates how these forecasters think and what bonds they share. What lies behind their
success? Are they good—or just lucky? What patterns have they unraveled? And are their forecasts really
right? He explores unanticipated commonalities and exposes unexpected juxtapositions. And sometimes, it is
not so much how good a prediction is in an absolute sense that matters but how good it is relative to the
competition. In other cases, prediction is still a very rudimentary—and dangerous—science. Silver observes
that the most accurate forecasters tend to have a superior command of probability, and they tend to be both
humble and hardworking. They distinguish the predictable from the unpredictable, and they notice a
thousand little details that lead them closer to the truth. Because of their appreciation of probability, they can
distinguish the signal from the noise. With everything from the health of the global economy to our ability to
fight terrorism dependent on the quality of our predictions, Nate Silver’s insights are an essential read.

Hollywood Drive

\"Hollywood Drive: What is Takes to Break in, Hang in & Make it in the Entertainment Industry is the
essential guide to starting and succeeding at a career in film and TV. Written by a Hollywood insider, Eve
Honthaner's invaluable advice will give those attempting to enter and become successful in the entertainment
industry the edge they need to stand out among the intense competition.\" \"Hollywood Drive goes beyond
what it takes to get you foot in the door by offering you the tools, attitude, philosophy and road map you'll
need to give yourself a good fighting chance at success - whether you're looking for you very first job or for a
strategy to move your career to the next level. This book will allow you to proceed with your eyes wide open,
knowing exactly what to expect.\"

Jack

The most widely respected CEO in America looks back on his brilliant career at General Electric and reveals
his personal business philosophy and unique managerial style. Nearly 20 years ago, former General Electric
CEO Reg Jones walked into Jack Welch's office and wrapped him in a bear hug. \"Congratulations, Mr.
Chairman,\" said Reg. It was a defining moment for American business. So begins the story of a self-made
man and a self-described rebel who thrived in one of the most volatile and economically robust eras in U.S.
history, while managing to maintain a unique leadership style. In what is the most anticipated book on
business management for our time, Jack Welch surveys the landscape of his career running one of the world's
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largest and most successful corporations.

The Advocate

The Advocate is a lesbian, gay, bisexual, transgender (LGBT) monthly newsmagazine. Established in 1967,
it is the oldest continuing LGBT publication in the United States.

The Film Book

Story of cinema -- How movies are made -- Movie genres -- World cinema -- A-Z directors -- Must-see
movies.

Corcoran Gallery of Art

This authoritative catalogue of the Corcoran Gallery of Art's renowned collection of pre-1945 American
paintings will greatly enhance scholarly and public understanding of one of the finest and most important
collections of historic American art in the world. Composed of more than 600 objects dating from 1740 to
1945.

Nineteen Eighty-Four

Nineteen Eighty-Four (1949) was George Orwell's final novel and was completed in difficult conditions
shortly before his early death. It is one of the most influential and widely-read novels of the post-war period.

Twelve Angry Men

A landmark American drama that inspired a classic film and a Broadway revival—featuring an introduction
by David Mamet A blistering character study and an examination of the American melting pot and the
judicial system that keeps it in check, Twelve Angry Men holds at its core a deeply patriotic faith in the U.S.
legal system. The play centers on Juror Eight, who is at first the sole holdout in an 11-1 guilty vote. Eight
sets his sights not on proving the other jurors wrong but rather on getting them to look at the situation in a
clear-eyed way not affected by their personal prejudices or biases. Reginald Rose deliberately and carefully
peels away the layers of artifice from the men and allows a fuller picture to form of them—and of America,
at its best and worst. After the critically acclaimed teleplay aired in 1954, this landmark American drama
went on to become a cinematic masterpiece in 1957 starring Henry Fonda, for which Rose wrote the
adaptation. More recently, Twelve Angry Men had a successful, and award-winning, run on Broadway. For
more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-speaking
world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best works
throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative texts
enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as up-to-
date translations by award-winning translators.

Hollywood's West

American historians such as Frederick Jackson Turner have argued that the West has been the region that
most clearly defines American democracy and the national ethos. Throughout the twentieth century, the
\"frontier thesis\" influenced film and television producers who used the West as a backdrop for an array of
dramatic explorations of America's history and the evolution of its culture and values. The common themes
found in Westerns distinguish the genre as a quintessentially American form of dramatic art. In Hollywood's
West, Peter C. Rollins, John E. O'Connor, and the nation's leading film scholars analyze popular conceptions
of the frontier as a fundamental element of American history and culture. This volume examines classic
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Western films and programs that span nearly a century, from Cimarron (1931) to Turner Network
Television's recent made-for-TV movies. Many of the films discussed here are considered among the greatest
cinematic landmarks of all time. The essays highlight the ways in which Westerns have both shaped and
reflected the dominant social and political concerns of their respective eras. While Cimarron challenged
audiences with an innovative, complex narrative, other Westerns of the early sound era such as The Great
Meadow (1931) frequently presented nostalgic visions of a simpler frontier era as a temporary diversion from
the hardships of the Great Depression. Westerns of the 1950s reveal the profound uncertainty cast by the cold
war, whereas later Westerns display heightened violence and cynicism, products of a society marred by wars,
assassinations, riots, and political scandals. The volume concludes with a comprehensive filmography and an
informative bibliography of scholarly writings on the Western genre. This collection will prove useful to film
scholars, historians, and both devoted and casual fans of the Western genre. Hollywood's West makes a
significant contribution to the understanding of both the historic American frontier and its innumerable
popular representations.

Film Remakes

This is the first book to provide a comprehensive and systematic account of the phenomenon of cinematic
remaking. Drawing upon recent theories of genre and intertextuality, Film Remakes describes remaking as
both an elastic concept and a complex situation, one enabled and limited by the interrelated roles and
practices of industry, critics, and audiences. This approach to remaking is developed across three broad
sections: the first deals with issues of production, including commerce and authors; the second considers
genre, plots, and structures; and the third investigates issues of reception, including audiences and
institutions.

Guide to U.S. Elections

The CQ Press Guide to U.S. Elections is a comprehensive, two-volume reference providing information on
the U.S. electoral process, in-depth analysis on specific political eras and issues, and everything in between.
Thoroughly revised and infused with new data, analysis, and discussion of issues relating to elections through
2014, the Guide will include chapters on: Analysis of the campaigns for presidency, from the primaries
through the general election Data on the candidates, winners/losers, and election returns Details on
congressional and gubernatorial contests supplemented with vast historical data. Key Features include:
Tables, boxes and figures interspersed throughout each chapter Data on campaigns, election methods, and
results Complete lists of House and Senate leaders Links to election-related websites A guide to party
abbreviations

Reputation

This work provides an analysis of the determinants and effects of reputation management. It demonstrates the
economic value of a corporate reputation, quantifying the economic returns for well-regarded companies, and
presents recommendations and processes for assessing and improving reputation. INDICE: Introduction: why
reputations matter. Part 1 The hidden value of a good reputation: going for the gold; what's in a name?;
enlightened self-inter... Etc.

Phat Beats, Dope Rhymes

How Aussies came to belong to the hip-hop nation.

The Art Of Seduction

Which sort of seducer could you be? Siren? Rake? Cold Coquette? Star? Comedian? Charismatic? Or Saint?
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This book will show you which. Charm, persuasion, the ability to create illusions: these are some of the many
dazzling gifts of the Seducer, the compelling figure who is able to manipulate, mislead and give pleasure all
at once. When raised to the level of art, seduction, an indirect and subtle form of power, has toppled empires,
won elections and enslaved great minds. In this beautiful, sensually designed book, Greene unearths the two
sides of seduction: the characters and the process. Discover who you, or your pursuer, most resembles. Learn,
too, the pitfalls of the anti-Seducer. Immerse yourself in the twenty-four manoeuvres and strategies of the
seductive process, the ritual by which a seducer gains mastery over their target. Understand how to 'Choose
the Right Victim', 'Appear to Be an Object of Desire' and 'Confuse Desire and Reality'. In addition, Greene
provides instruction on how to identify victims by type. Each fascinating character and each cunning tactic
demonstrates a fundamental truth about who we are, and the targets we've become - or hope to win over. The
Art of Seduction is an indispensable primer on the essence of one of history's greatest weapons and the
ultimate power trip. From the internationally bestselling author of The 48 Laws of Power, Mastery, and The
33 Strategies Of War.

The Great Transformation

Drawing on previously untapped archival materials including letters, interviews, and more, Bernard F. Dick
traces the history of Columbia Pictures, from its beginnings as the CBC Film Sales Company, through the
regimes of Harry Cohn and his successors, and ending with a vivid portrait of today's corporate Hollywood.
The book offers unique perspectives on the careers of Rita Hayworth and Judy Holliday, a discussion of
Columbia's unique brands of screwball comedy and film noir, and analyses of such classics as The Awful
Truth, Born Yesterday, and From Here to Eternity. Following the author's highly readable studio chronicle
are fourteen original essays by leading film scholars that follow Columbia's emergence from Poverty Row
status to world class, and the stars, films, genres, writers, producers, and directors responsible for its
transformation. A new essay on Quentin Tarantino's Once Upon a Time...in Hollywood rounds out the
collection and brings this seminal studio history into the 21st century. Amply illustrated with film stills and
photos of stars and studio heads, Columbia Pictures is the first book to integrate history with criticism of a
single studio, and is ideal for film lovers and scholars alike.

Columbia Pictures

An Anthropology of Landscape tells the fascinating story of a heathland landscape in south-west England
and the way different individuals and groups engage with it. Based on a long-term anthropological study, the
book emphasises four individual themes: embodied identities, the landscape as a sensuous material form that
is acted upon and in turn acts on people, the landscape as contested, and its relation to emotion. The
landscape is discussed in relation to these themes as both ‘taskscape’ and ‘leisurescape’, and from the
perspective of different user groups. First, those who manage the landscape and use it for work:
conservationists, environmentalists, archaeologists, the Royal Marines, and quarrying interests. Second, those
who use it in their leisure time: cyclists and horse riders, model aircraft flyers, walkers, people who fish
there, and artists who are inspired by it. The book makes an innovative contribution to landscape studies and
will appeal to all those interested in nature conservation, historic preservation, the politics of nature, the
politics of identity, and an anthropology of Britain.

Anthropology of Landscape

Requirements for professional media editing have undergone enormous technological change. Editors still
edit copy. But today they do much more. Mass media editors must demonstrate skills from computerized
pagination to social media monitoring, from image manipulation to Search Engine Optimization. The need
for editing skills is reaching far beyond traditional journalism and into all areas of mass media, from
newspapers to strategic communication. Public relations practitioners are expected to edit. Even advertising
creative professionals must edit. And journalists taking on new roles as social media editors need to
understand editing at the speed of digital media. This textbook aims to prepare university-level students for
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these expanded editing roles in an age of convergence. Thirteen authors representing many years of collective
media experience examine both traditional editing roles and new editing needs. While many mass media
students will not become professional editors, this textbook assumes nearly all will need competent editing
knowledge to produce products of professional quality. Editing, the authors believe, remains a bedrock skill
for all students who hope to be successful in the mass media. Instructors considering this book for use in a
course may request an examination copy here.

Editing Across Media

This is a guide to the main developments in the history of British and Irish literature, charting some of the
main features of literary language development and highlighting key language topics.

The Routledge History of Literature in English

A collection of crime stories that take place in Seattle.

Art Worlds

What's it like to start a revolution? How do you build the biggest tech company in the world? And why do
you walk away from it all? Paul Allen co-founded Microsoft. Together he and Bill Gates turned an idea
writing software into a company and then an entire industry. This is the story of how it came about: two
young mavericks who turned technology on its head; the bitter battles as each tried to stamp his vision on the
future; and, the ruthless brilliance and fierce commitment. And finally, Allen's extraordinary step in walking
away from it all to discover what it is you do after you've already changed the world.

Seattle Noir

Screenwriting: Creative Labor and Professional Practice analyzes the histories, practices, identities and
subjects which form and shape the daily working lives of screenwriters. Author Bridget Conor considers the
ways in which contemporary screenwriters navigate and make sense of the labor markets in which they are
immersed. Chapters explore areas including: Screenwriting histories and myths of the profession
Screenwriting as creative labor Screenwriters’ working lives Screenwriting work and the how-to genre
Screenwriting work and inequalities Drawing on historical and critical perspectives of mainstream
screenwriting in the USA and UK, as well as valuable interviews with working screenwriters, this book
presents a highly original and multi-faceted study of screenwriting as creative labor and professional practice.

Idea Man

Filmmakers have often encouraged us to regard people with physical disabilities in terms of pity, awe,
humor, or fearas \"Others\" who somehow deserve to be isolated from the rest of society. In this first history
of the portrayal of physical disability in the movies, Martin Norden examines hundreds of Hollywood movies
(and notable international ones), finds their place within mainstream society, and uncovers the movie
industry's practices for maintaining the status quokeeping people with disabilities dependent and \"in their
place.\" Norden offers a dazzling array of physically disabled characters who embody or break out of the
stereotypes that have both influenced and been symptomatic of societys fluctuating relationship with its
physically disabled minority. He shows us \"sweet innocents\" like Tiny Tim, \"obsessive avengers\" like
Quasimodo, variations on the disabled veteran, and many others. He observes the arrival of a new set of
stereotypes tied to the growth of science and technology in the 1970s and 1980s, and underscores movies like
My Left Foot and The Waterdance that display a newfound sensitivity. Nordens in-depth knowledge of
disability history makes for a particularly intelligent and sensitive approach to this long-overlooked issue in
media studies.
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Screenwriting

This riveting work of investigative reporting and history exposes classified government projects to build
gravity-defying aircraft--which have an uncanny resemblance to flying saucers. The atomic bomb was not the
only project to occupy government scientists in the 1940s. Antigravity technology, originally spearheaded by
scientists in Nazi Germany, was another high priority, one that still may be in effect today. Now for the first
time, a reporter with an unprecedented access to key sources in the intelligence and military communities
reveals suppressed evidence that tells the story of a quest for a discovery that could prove as powerful as the
A-bomb. The Hunt for Zero Point explores the scientific speculation that a \"zero point\" of gravity exists in
the universe and can be replicated here on Earth. The pressure to be the first nation to harness gravity is
immense, as it means having the ability to build military planes of unlimited speed and range, along with the
most deadly weaponry the world has ever seen. The ideal shape for a gravity-defying vehicle happens to be a
perfect disk, making antigravity tests a possible explanation for the numerous UFO sightings of the past 50
years. Chronicling the origins of antigravity research in the world's most advanced research facility, which
was operated by the Third Reich during World War II, The Hunt for Zero Point traces U.S. involvement in
the project, beginning with the recruitment of former Nazi scientists after the war. Drawn from interviews
with those involved with the research and who visited labs in Europe and the United States, The Hunt for
Zero Point journeys to the heart of the twentieth century's most puzzling unexplained phenomena.

The Cinema of Isolation

Resource for teachers, across all curriculum areas, wishing to develop their pupils/ students thinking about
disability, as an equality issue. The pack will help all young people develop a more critical approach to the
representation of disabled people in the media.

The Hunt for Zero Point

* An essential resource for all development agencies seeking to include people with disabilities* User-
friendly tools and practical advice from experienced practitionersThere are four hundred million people with
disabilities living in developing countries today. All too often they live in poverty and isolation. If
development is to truly address the needs of the poor and marginalized, the inclusion of people with
disabilities is crucial. Building an Inclusive Development Community is a toolkit for development agencies
and others concerned with the participation of people with disabilities at all levels and in all areas of the
international development process. The manual is organized into issues and includes helpful worksheets, best
practice examples, resources and much more.

Disabling Imagery

SUSAN CAIN'S NEW BOOK, BITTERSWEET, IS AVAILABLE TO PRE-ORDER NOW A SUNDAY
TIMES AND NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER, THIS BOOK WILL CHANGE HOW YOU SEE
INTROVERTS - AND YOURSELF - FOREVER. Our lives are driven by a fact that most of us can't name
and don't understand. It defines who our friends and lovers are, which careers we choose, and whether we
blush when we're embarrassed. That fact is whether we're an introvert or an extrovert. The most fundamental
dimension of personality, at least a third of us are introverts, and yet shyness, sensitivity and seriousness are
often seen as a negative. Some of the world's most talented people are introverts - without them we wouldn't
have the Apple computer, the theory of relativity and Van Gogh's sunflowers. In Quiet, Susan Cain shows
how society misunderstands and undervalues introverts while giving them the tools to better understand
themselves and take full advantage of their strengths. Passionately argued, superbly researched, and filled
with real stories, whether an introvert or extrovert, this book will change how you see human beings for
good. ***** 'I can't get Quiet out of my head. It is an important book - so persuasive and timely and heartfelt
it should inevitably effect change in schools and offices' Jon Ronson, The Guardian 'Susan Cain's Quiet has
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sparked a quiet revolution . . . Perhaps rather than sitting back and asking people to speak up, managers and
company leaders might lean forward and listen' Megan Walsh, The Times 'Maybe the extrovert ideal is no
longer as powerful as it was; perhaps it is time we all stopped to listen to the still, small voice of calm' Daisy
Goodwin, The Sunday Times

Building an Inclusive Development Community

NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER • Over a million copies sold! “An eminently practical guide to an
emotionally intelligent—and long-lasting—marriage.”—Daniel Goleman, author of Emotional Intelligence
The Seven Principles for Making Marriage Work has revolutionized the way we understand, repair, and
strengthen marriages. John Gottman’s unprecedented study of couples over a period of years has allowed him
to observe the habits that can make—and break—a marriage. Here is the culmination of that work: the seven
principles that guide couples on a path toward a harmonious and long-lasting relationship. Straightforward
yet profound, these principles teach partners new approaches for resolving conflicts, creating new common
ground, and achieving greater levels of intimacy. Gottman offers strategies and resources to help couples
collaborate more effectively to resolve any problem, whether dealing with issues related to sex, money,
religion, work, family, or anything else. Packed with new exercises and the latest research out of the
esteemed Gottman Institute, this revised edition of The Seven Principles for Making Marriage Work is the
definitive guide for anyone who wants their relationship to attain its highest potential.

Quiet

In December 2008, twentysomething Jill Grunenwald graduated with her master’s degree in library science,
ready to start living her dream of becoming a librarian. But the economy had a different idea. As the Great
Recession reared its ugly head, jobs were scarce. After some searching, however, Jill was lucky enough to
snag one of the few librarian gigs left in her home state of Ohio. The catch? The job was behind bars as the
prison librarian at a men’s minimum-security prison. Talk about baptism by fire. As an untested
twentysomething woman, to say that the job was out of Jill’s comfort zone was an understatement. She was
forced to adapt on the spot, speedily learning to take the metal detectors, hulking security guards, and
colorful inmates in stride. Over the course of a little less than two years, Jill came to see past the bleak
surroundings and the orange jumpsuits and recognize the humanity of the men stuck behind bars. They were
just like every other library patron—persons who simply wanted to read, to be educated and entertained
through the written word. By helping these inmates, Jill simultaneously began to recognize the humanity in
everyone and to discover inner strength that she never knew she had. At turns poignant and hilarious,
Reading behind Bars is a perfect read for fans of Orange is the New Black and Shakespeare Saved My Life.

Longman Advanced Learners' Grammar

This is a history of the Japanese art world from 1990 up to the tsunami of March 2011, and its struggle to
find a voice amidst Japan's economic decline and China's economic ascent. It looks at how the pop-culture
fantasies of Takashi Murakami, Yoshitomo Nara and the other artists of the Superflat movement came to
dominate the art of Japan today. It also delves into what lies behind their imagery of a childish and decadent
society unable to face reality.

Business Ethics

A polemic against love that is “engagingly acerbic ... extremely funny.... A deft indictment of the marital
ideal, as well as a celebration of the dissent that constitutes adultery, delivered in pointed daggers of prose”
(The New Yorker). Who would dream of being against love? No one. Love is, as everyone knows, a
mysterious and all-controlling force, with vast power over our thoughts and life decisions. But is there
something a bit worrisome about all this uniformity of opinion? Is this the one subject about which no
disagreement will be entertained, about which one truth alone is permissible? Consider that the most
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powerful organized religions produce the occasional heretic; every ideology has its apostates; even sacred
cows find their butchers. Except for love. Hence the necessity for a polemic against it. A polemic is designed
to be the prose equivalent of a small explosive device placed under your E-Z-Boy lounger. It won’t injure
you (well not severely); it’s just supposed to shake things up and rattle a few convictions.

The Seven Principles for Making Marriage Work

Reading behind Bars
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